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The algebraic techniques developed by Kakde will almost certainly lead eventually to major progress in the
study of congruences between automorphic forms and the main conjectures of non-commutative Iwasawa
theory for many motives. Non-commutative Iwasawa theory has emerged dramatically over the last decade,
culminating in the recent proof of the non-commutative main conjecture for the Tate motive over a totally
real p-adic Lie extension of a number field, independently by Ritter and Weiss on the one hand, and Kakde
on the other. The initial ideas for giving a precise formulation of the non-commutative main conjecture were
discovered by Venjakob, and were then systematically developed  in the subsequent papers by Coates-
Fukaya-Kato-Sujatha-Venjakob and Fukaya-Kato. There was also parallel related work in this direction by
Burns and Flach on the equivariant Tamagawa number conjecture. Subsequently, Kato discovered an
important idea for studying the K_1 groups of non-abelian Iwasawa algebras in terms of the K_1 groups of
the abelian quotients of these Iwasawa algebras. Kakde's proof is a beautiful development of these ideas of
Kato, combined with an idea of Burns, and essentially reduces the study of the non-abelian main conjectures
to abelian ones. The approach of Ritter and Weiss is more classical, and partly inspired by techniques of
Frohlich and Taylor. Since many of the ideas in this book should eventually be applicable to other motives,
one of its major aims is to provide a self-contained exposition of some of the main general themes
underlying these developments. The present volume will be a valuable resource for researchers working in
both Iwasawa theory and the theory of automorphic forms.
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From reader reviews:

Margaret Watkins:

Within other case, little individuals like to read book Noncommutative Iwasawa Main Conjectures over
Totally Real Fields: Münster, April 2011 (Springer Proceedings in Mathematics & Statistics). You can
choose the best book if you like reading a book. Providing we know about how is important any book
Noncommutative Iwasawa Main Conjectures over Totally Real Fields: Münster, April 2011 (Springer
Proceedings in Mathematics & Statistics). You can add expertise and of course you can around the world by
just a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can recognize everything! From your country
until finally foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About simple thing until wonderful thing it is
possible to know that. In this era, we can open a book or maybe searching by internet gadget. It is called e-
book. You need to use it when you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's learn.

Ronda Tollison:

This book untitled Noncommutative Iwasawa Main Conjectures over Totally Real Fields: Münster, April
2011 (Springer Proceedings in Mathematics & Statistics) to be one of several books that best seller in this
year, that is because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy this
specific book in the book shop or you can order it by way of online. The publisher with this book sells the e-
book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, because you can read this book in your Cell phone. So
there is no reason to you personally to past this e-book from your list.

Edward Franco:

In this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more important than
other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you have to do is just
spending your time not very much but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of several books in
the top checklist in your reading list will be Noncommutative Iwasawa Main Conjectures over Totally Real
Fields: Münster, April 2011 (Springer Proceedings in Mathematics & Statistics). This book which can be
qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking way up and review
this e-book you can get many advantages.

Mary Perez:

As a college student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the
library or even make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's
heart or real their hobby. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to generally
there but nothing reading really. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring along with can't see
colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know that
on this period, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
So , this Noncommutative Iwasawa Main Conjectures over Totally Real Fields: Münster, April 2011



(Springer Proceedings in Mathematics & Statistics) can make you experience more interested to read.
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