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The fifth book in the OMEGA series! War is a violent thing, but sometimes inevitable. Both sides suffer.
When allies become enemies, and enemies become allies, who do you trust? Sides must be taken. Lives will
be lost.

Also available from this author:

SODIUM Series

A six-book series that takes Man from his first encounter with aliens all the way to a fight for our all-out
survival. Do we have what it takes to rule the galaxy?

AMP Series

Cast a thousand years into the future beyond SODIUM. This eight-book series chronicles the struggles of
Don Grange, a simple package deliveryman, who is thrust into an unimaginable role in the fight against our
enemies. Can we win peace and freedom after a thousand years of war?

OMEGA Series

Cast a thousand years into the future beyond AMP. The Alliance is crumbling. When corruption and politics
threaten to throw the allied galaxies into chaos, Knog Beutcher gets caught in the middle. Follow along as
our hero is thrust into roles that he never expected or sought. Espionage, intrigue, political assassinations,
rebellions and full-on revolutions, they are all coming to Knog Beutcher's world!

HADRON Series

HADRON is a modern day story unrelated to the SODIUM-AMP-OMEGA trilogy series. After scientists
using the Large Hadron Collider discover dark matter, the world is plunged into chaos. Massive waves of
electromagnetic interference take out all grid power and forms of communication the world over. Cities go
dark, food and water supplies are quickly used up, and marauders rule the highways. One group of citizens
takes a stand. Can they make a difference? And the devastating EM waves, where are they coming from?
After months of starvation, a benevolent species arrive in their spaceships to rescue the Human race. Only,
are they really so benevolent?

ARMS Series

ARMS is set in the future after Earth was nearing an apocalyptic event. Two competing colony ships were
built, taking five million inhabitants each through a wormhole to a pair of newly discovered planets. The
planets were settled and not long after the colonies looked to the surrounding star systems for ownership and
expansion, which led to a centuries long war between them. A truce was declared after the aggressor side
began to lose ground.

Tawnish Freely and Harris Gruberg are genetically engineered Biomarines. Their lives have been dedicated



to fighting the war. They find themselves struggling to find work among a population that fears them. Work
is found only by delving into the delivery of illegal arms to the outer colonies. Things go awry when they
discover their illicit dealings may just be the catalyst that brings back the Great War. They are determined to
prevent that from happening.
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From reader reviews:

Joshua Rodrigue:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a book. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the guide entitled OMEGA Hostile. Try to make the book OMEGA Hostile as
your pal. It means that it can being your friend when you feel alone and beside that course make you smarter
than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you a lot more confidence because
you can know anything by the book. So , let me make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Deborah Hagan:

The reason? Because this OMEGA Hostile is an unordinary book that the inside of the e-book waiting for
you to snap the item but latter it will surprise you with the secret it inside. Reading this book next to it was
fantastic author who all write the book in such remarkable way makes the content on the inside easier to
understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is good for you for not hesitating
having this ever again or you going to regret it. This unique book will give you a lot of rewards than the
other book have such as help improving your talent and your critical thinking means. So , still want to delay
having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the publication store hurriedly.

Carol Shull:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't determine book by its include may
doesn't work is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the
outside look likes. Maybe you answer may be OMEGA Hostile why because the amazing cover that make
you consider concerning the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content will be fantastic as the
outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Michael Spicer:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is written or printed or highlighted from each source in which filled update of news. On this
modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media social
similar to newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add
your understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
searching for the OMEGA Hostile when you essential it?
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