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 Statistics is confusing, even for smart, technically competent people. And many students and
professionals find that existing books and web resources don’t give them an intuitive understanding of
confusing statistical concepts. That is why this book is needed. Some of the unique qualities of this book are:

• Easy to Understand: Uses unique “graphics that teach” such as concept flow diagrams, compare-and-
contrast tables, and even cartoons to enhance “rememberability.”

• Easy to Use: Alphabetically arranged, like a mini-encyclopedia, for easy lookup on the job, while studying,
or during an open-book exam.

• Wider Scope: Covers Statistics I and Statistics II and Six Sigma Black Belt, adding such topics as control
charts and statistical process control, process capability analysis, and design of experiments. As a result, this
book will be useful for business professionals and industrial engineers in addition to students and
professionals in the social and physical sciences.

In addition, each of the 60+ concepts is covered in one or more articles. The 75 articles in the book are
usually 5–7 pages long, ensuring that things are presented in “bite-sized chunks.” The first page of each
article typically lists five “Keys to Understanding” which tell the reader everything they need to know on one
page. This book also contains an article on “Which Statistical Tool to Use to Solve Some Common
Problems”, additional “Which to Use When” articles on Control Charts, Distributions, and
Charts/Graphs/Plots, as well as articles explaining how different concepts work together (e.g., how Alpha, p,
Critical Value, and Test Statistic interrelate).

ANDREW A. JAWLIK received his B.S. in Mathematics and his M.S. in Mathematics and Computer
Science from the University of Michigan. He held jobs with IBM in marketing, sales, finance, and
information technology, as well as a position as Process Executive. In these jobs, he learned how to
communicate difficult technical concepts in easy - to - understand terms. He completed Lean Six Sigma
Black Belt coursework at the IASSC - accredited Pyzdek Institute. In order to understand the confusing
statistics involved, he wrote explanations in his own words and graphics. Using this material, he passed the
certification exam with a perfect score. Those statistical explanations then became the starting point for this
book.
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From reader reviews:

Sylvia Cunningham:

Book is actually written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can realize everything you want by a e-
book. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important point to bring us around the
world. Alongside that you can your reading skill was fluently. A guide Statistics from A to Z: Confusing
Concepts Clarified will make you to be smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know about
almost everything. But some of you think which open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It is not
make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or ideal book with you?

Nora Cordova:

The guide with title Statistics from A to Z: Confusing Concepts Clarified includes a lot of information that
you can find out it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This specific book exist new
understanding the information that exist in this guide represented the condition of the world today. That is
important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you inside new era of
the the positive effect. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you
want.

Cheree Rodriquez:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them
friends and family or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just
watching TV, or playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity that is look different
you can read a new book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent all
day every day to reading a book. The book Statistics from A to Z: Confusing Concepts Clarified it doesn't
matter what good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. These people were enjoying
reading this book. Should you did not have enough space to create this book you can buy typically the e-
book. You can m0ore simply to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not too expensive but
this book provides high quality.

Marylou Arroyo:

You may spend your free time to learn this book this guide. This Statistics from A to Z: Confusing Concepts
Clarified is simple to deliver you can read it in the area, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not
have got much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you easier
to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will
get when you buy this book.
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